
[bookmark: OLE_LINK3]MINUTES
5/17/2011
Regular Town Board Meeting
Town Hall – Swiss Miss Center 1101 Hwy 69 New Glarus @ 6:30 PM


ATTENDING:	Board Members: Keith Seward, Dean Streiff, C. Narveson, Jim Hoesly, Robert Elkins, Patrolman Dennis Nielson, and Deputy Clerk John Wright

ALSO ATTENDING:	Travis Schreiber (Vierbicher Associates – departed 7:21 PM), Dale Hustad (Town Counsel) and Lexie Duval Harris (Remax – departed 6:48 PM)

CALL TO ORDER: 	K. Seward called the meeting to order at 6:30 PM – Swiss Miss Center  

PROOF OF POSTING:	The Chair and Deputy Clerk attested to proper proof of posting

Discussion/Motion: 	D. Streiff moved approve Annual Meeting minutes of 4/12/2011; R. Elkins 2nd.  Motion carried.

Discussion/Motion: 	R. Elkins moved approve the regular minutes of 4/12/2011; J. Hoesly 2nd.  Motion carried.

Discussion/Motion:	Neighbor Exchange Recorded by CSM between Ruth Ann Pauli and William and Diane Campbell - Realtor Lexie Duval Harris attended this evening to represent her client Ruth Ann Pauli.  Pauli currently owns two adjacent parcels on CTH 69: Lot 1 of Certified Survey Map (CSM) 1308 filed with County in 1992 containing 18.320 acres; and 1.520 acres described by metes and bounds that was transferred to the Paulis by quit claim deed from neighbors Juanita and Gerald Dahlen in 1993 (see attached).  Ms. Harris referred the trustees to the yellow-coded portion on a copy of CSM 1308 that had been marked by the surveyor at the time “(1.843 Acres) of Probable Adverse Contention.” Of that acreage, Ms. Pauli will file a quit claim deed for approximately 1.80 acres of this property to her neighbors to the south, the Campbells.  Harris also noted a small corner on the southwestern edge of CSM 1308 coded in orange will be retained by Pauli; this corner has been maintained by Pauli since 1993 and is needed for access to the existing driveway.  Dale Hustad noted the period for adverse possession is twenty years.  

Ms. Harris shared a draft CSM (see attached) prepared by surveyor Thom Grenlie that consolidates the two aforementioned properties owned by Ms. Pauli and excludes the portion to be quit claimed to the Campbells. Lot 1 of the proposed CSM contains 18.210 acres.  C. Narveson confirmed with Harris that the exchange of land with the Campbells will be executed by quit claim deed.  Chair Seward asked if the Campbells have seen and approved of the proposed CSM; Harris has just received a copy of this document today and plans on discussing it with the Campbells tomorrow.  Harris noted that Green County Zoning Administrator Adam Wiegel sent her a letter notifying her that the County will not need to review this as a land division; it is a neighbor exchange and consolidation of parcels.  C. Narveson expressed his concern about the Campbells’ reaction to accepting the land quit claimed to them and the Pauli retention of the small corner (color-coded in orange) for access purposes.  

K. Seward confirmed with Dale Hustad that the proposed quit claim deed will name the Campbells as the recipient; the deed will not include a warranty.  Hustad suggested that the yellow-coded portion should be quit claimed to the Campbells and the Campbells should be contacted to release any interest in the orange-coded portion by quit claim deed to Ms. Pauli.  Chair Seward noted a neighbor exchange does not require a public hearing or an appearance before the Plan Commission.  Dale Hustad did not recommend Town review of the quit claim deeds, providing the CSM reflects those proposed changes discussed. Action: R. Elkins made a motion to authorize the Town Chair to sign the final copy of the CSM; 2nd D. Streiff.  Motion carried.  Lexie Duval Harris was instructed to return with a recordable, archival copy of the CSM for the Town Chair to sign.

Patrolman’s Report:	Spring Road Maintenance Bids – Engineer’s Recommendation - Travis Schreiber of Vierbicher Associates stated that the Town received five bids; not all of the bids included all schedules.  Of the five, Green County Highway Department was the lowest bidder on all schedules at $123,461.  The bid on all schedules from Rock Road totaled $189,852.41.  The budgeted amount for all schedules was $ 140,000.  Schreiber recommended to the Town that they award the work to Green County Highway Department.  K. Seward noted that County cannot legally submit a firm bid, only an estimate; however, Seward noted that in the past County estimates have been very close to the actual charges.

Schedule A - Wedging and Patching - as marked
	Company
	Valley View 
	Farmers Grove 
	Meadow Valley
	Airport Road
	Exeter Xing
	Disch Road
	Zentner Road
	Total

	Green Co. Hwy
	$10,676
	$37,740
	$10,948
	$11,764
	$1,836
	$5,304
	$8,500
	$86,768

	Scott Const.
	$25,568
	$72,783
	$18,521
	$23,024
	$9,852
	$12,149
	$18,299
	$180,196

	Rock Road
	$18,445
	$45,900
	$11,220
	$11,900
	$30,260
	$9,405
	$9,702
	$136,832

	Payne & Dolan
	$23,500
	$84,000
	$19,750
	$25,400
	$5,800
	$13,400
	$19,800
	$191,650

	Fahrner
	no bid
	no bid
	no bid
	no bid
	no bid
	no bid
	no bid
	$0



Schedule B - Chip Seal
	Company
	Disch Road
	Exeter Crossing
	Total

	Green Co. Hwy
	$16,629
	$14,859
	$31,488

	Scott Construction
	$21,595
	$17,738.75
	$39,333.75

	Rock Road
	$22,465.28
	$18,453.62
	$40,918.90

	Payne & Dolan
	no bid
	no bid
	$0

	Fahrner
	$22,347
	$19,902
	$42,249



Schedule C – Crack Fill
	Company
	Old Madison Road(CTHO-STH69)
	Total

	Green Co. Hwy
	$2,875
	$2,875

	Scott Construction
	$5,000
	$5,000

	Rock Road
	$5,201.50
	$5,201.50

	Payne & Dolan
	no bid
	$0

	Fahrner
	$4,300
	$4,300



Schedule D – Culvert Replacement
	Company
	Farmers Grove
	Total

	Green Co. Hwy
	$2,330
	$2,330

	Scott Construction
	no bid
	$0

	Rock Road
	$6,900
	$6,900

	Payne & Dolan
	no bid
	$0

	Fahrner
	no bid
	$0



C. Narveson moved to approve Green County Highway Department for all schedules of the bid; 2nd J. Hoesly.  J. Hoesly confirmed the location of the culvert; it will be located on Farmers Grove Road.  Motion carried. 

Bjoin Limestone, Inc. Road Repair – K. Seward volunteered to contact Bjoin about damage to Exeter Crossing Road from their driveway to STH 69 attributable to their vehicles.  Seward asked this body what it considers to be an adequate repair.  The group agreed adequate repair would be to patch and wedge; without objection.  D. Neilson thought Bjoin should be made aware that Green County will be doing work for the Town and that Bjoin could potentially contract with County to perform this repair while they are in the Town.  Dale Hustad recalled the repair agreement with Bjoin was part of the Town’s input to Green County Zoning when a Conditional Use Permit was requested by Bjoin.

Zentner Road TRIP Money – $425,000 has been estimated for the second phase of Zentner Road.  Travis Schreiber stated he prepared a proposed schedule: a bid package could be organized and an ad submitted for publication by June 3rd; the first and second appearance in print would be June 10th and June 17th respectively; the bid opening could be conducted on June 24th; and the bid awarded at the July 5, 2011 Regular Town Board meeting.  K. Seward asked Schreiber his opinion of current prices from contractors; Schreiber thought they were low at beginning of the year.  However, Schreiber noted, prices fluctuate with the price of gasoline.  Schreiber stated his estimate of $65/ton for asphalt was a conservative figure.  R. Elkins asked the cost of completed phase 1 for Zentner Road; J. Hoesly thought around $380,000.  Phase 2, the center section of Zentner is estimated by the engineer to cost $425,000 as a discretionary total.

Patrolman Nielson requested a decision so he knows whether to pursue patching work in Phase 2 of approximately one mile in length.  Schreiber stated the proposed work for this phase includes pulverizing, overlaying, improving shoulders, and ditching.  Travis Schreiber does not recommend an overlay only, which is an expensive, temporary fix.  K. Seward noted that the proposed State budget cap would result in no Town budget increases for two years and will likely level out at 1.5% by the third year; revenue sharing income is down slightly and road participation by the State will be reduced.  Seward went on to note that there are possible increases in budget requests for the Town related to negotiation discussions with the Village; however, Seward did note that the roads will not improve without action, whether that is now or later.  

D. Streiff asked whether the difference between the bids from Green County Highway Department and what was budgeted ($16,539) can be put towards the second phase of Zentner.  D. Nielson noted that the $5,000 budgeted for patching this section of Zentner would not be needed if Phase 2 resurfacing was approved; Green County Highway Department’s accepted bid for asphalt patching and wedging is $8,500 for Phase 2 and 3.  C. Narveson noted that the cost of borrowing this year is relatively inexpensive and likely to go up next year if the project is deferred.  The group discussed the fact that Zentner needs repair, but it is a lightly travelled road.  Travis Schreiber stated a combination of patching, wedging, and chip sealing could extend the life of the road for two to three years; however, the fact remains that the road is still at the end of its useful life.  

C. Narveson asked Schreiber for his thoughts about a new process of pulverizing with a polymer additive.  Narveson wondered if pulverizing only the shoulders made sense as the center section wears away less rapidly.  Travis Schreiber stated he would need to re-examine the cracking of the road to consider that option, but noted any patching would still show through.  Schreiber could not recommend another method for extending the life of a road at the end of its useful life.  Action: J. Hoesly made a motion to postpone resurfacing the second phase of Zentner Road until 2012 for further discussion at that time; 2nd B. Elkins.  D. Nielson will have Green County Highway patch within the $5,000 budgeted in the Phase 2 area.  Motion carried.

Chair Seward noted that TRIP money totaling approximately $27,000 for resurfacing Zentner Road is available through 2015; if all three phases are not completed by that date the Town will not receive the money.  Action: C. Narveson moved for Public Comments to be moved ahead in the agenda so that he could discuss a topic not included on the agenda with Travis Schreiber; 2nd J. Hoesly.  K. Seward stated there can be discussion only; no action is allowed for an item not included on the agenda.  Motion carried.  

Public Comments:	C. Narveson asked D. Nielson if the test patches on Legler Valley Road to address seasonal dips were an improvement; Nielson replied this method was an improvement over the existing conditions, but not to the degree that the technique should be applied to the rest of the road.  D. Nielson reported the test area without a culvert had the clear stone removed, was backfilled with native material, and paved; in his opinion it was not an improvement.  Chair Seward asked Travis Schreiber if he could estimate the cost of installing new culverts along the length of Legler Valley Road; he did not have that information available this evening.  Patrolman Nielson used the bid amount of $2,300 from Green County Highway for culvert replacement on Farmers Grove Road as a probable cost per culvert; there are 21 culverts on Legler Valley Road for a total of $48,300 assuming the per item cost.  

Travis Schreiber conjectured that the high water table combined with the peating material that is prone to swelling is creating the problem in those point locations where there is a culvert, resulting in differential settling.  D. Nielson noted Green County Highway has struggled with a similar problem on CTH H; eventually they resigned themselves to the fact that they could not change those conditions and install season signs warning of bumps.  J. Hoesly asked if the road itself was in good enough condition to consider Schreiber’s proposed solution to install a concrete cap to span the culverts.  Chair Seward responded that the road is in good shape and was resurfaced when Mark Renner was Town Chair, five to eight years ago.  Chair Seward returned to the continuation of the Patrolman’s Report; without objection. 

Patrolman’s Report:	Discarded Electronics Collection – Wright recalls that Pattie Salter had contact with the Town’s Route Manager from Waste Management and the two collaborated to schedule a special electronics collection at an approximate cost of $624.  K. Seward recalled that Clerk-Treasurer Salter was to coordinate with the School District of New Glarus for an electronics collection.  Wright was aware of a collection the School District conducted that the Town posted in the same locations we post agendas.  K. Seward recommended adding this item to the next agenda; without objection.

Sale of FWD – the vehicle sold to Green County Landfill for $2,650; D. Nielson reported the vehicle was resold to an individual from Argyle who picked it up from the Town Garage today.

Sign Retroreflectivity Plan – It was noted the person inspecting the reflectivity of existing signs must be 60 years of age or older, the crew consists of two members, and the vehicle must be an SUV or pickup truck, model year 2000 or newer.  K. Seward asked for volunteers if the Town decides to pursue the Visual Assessment method.  J. Hoesly volunteered to drive.  Inspection must be conducted for all 275 signs on approximately 40 miles of roads travelling both directions.  K. Seward wondered if a percentage can be inspected each year.  The method employed needs to be decided by 2012; it was noted that Green County owns a $12,000 machine that can test signs at all hours unlike the Vision Assessment method that can only be conducted at night.  C. Narveson suggested contacting Green County to find out how much they would charge to do the work; K. Seward will contact Jeff Wunschel tomorrow about County conducting the PACE study and will ask him about the cost to conduct the retroreflectivity study.  D. Nielson reminded Seward that Seward will need to sign the work orders before Green County Highway can begin their work for the Town. 

Mailbox Reimbursement Request – Part-time Town snow plow driver Jim Schwoerer hit Mike McKeon’s mailbox this past winter and told him that the Town would replace it. The least expensive replacement was at Loewe’s for $58.48. K. Seward thought the Board should establish a policy before setting a precedent. 

K. Seward asked members if they wanted to establish a policy that includes:  replacement; a maximum for reimbursement; and setbacks.  D. Hustad stated a public hearing would not be required for establishing a new policy.  C. Narveson would like a policy that requires placement of boxes on only one side of the road; Seward thought that was determined by the Postal Service.  Narveson thought the Town should be able to determine placement because they are located within the right-of-way.  K. Seward requested for the Deputy Clerk to find out Postal Service regulations for mailbox placement and setbacks.  D. Nielson noted that in the past the unwritten policy was to replace the box if hit by the plow, but not to do so if knocked over by the snow pushed by the plow.  Nielson stated Green County stocks aluminum replacement mailboxes that they install if they are at fault for knocking down.  Dale Hustad recommended notifying owners of boxes too near the edge of the road to relocate them; otherwise they would not qualify for reimbursement.  K. Seward noted that if a box has been hit once it will likely be hit again if the replacement is installed in the same location.  

Patrolman Nielson considers in this particular situation, that the Town plow driver was at fault, not the placement of the box.  K. Seward asked if there was any objection to paying the replacement cost of $58.48 to Mr. McKeon due to driver responsibility; without objection.  

Finance Committee Report:
Accounts Receivable Aging List - D. Streiff reviewed those items which have been billed by the Town. D. Streiff reported that Clerk-Treasurer, Salter had reimbursed the $1 credit to Homestead Title Company and the current receivables are at zero. 

Driveway Refunds – None submitted.

Accounting Reports and Bank Reconciliation - Reports were handed out to all board members.  The reports zeroed out.

Approval and Payment of Bills – C. Narveson moved to approve April checks: 16136-16139, J. Hoesly 2nd.  Deputy Clerk Wright questioned the check range; according to the notes from the Clerk-Treasurer, the first check should be 16135.  D. Streiff confirmed the first check in the range according to his April Statement of Cash Flow is 16136. Motion carried.

D. Streiff moved to approve May checks: 16140-16165 and ACH payments 19472, 23150, 71683, and 82102; 2nd C. Narveson. K. Seward questioned payments to Green County Highway Commission totaling $ 7,096.04; was this for work in 2010? Motion carried.

Balance sheets – D. Streiff stated there is $255,000 in savings, $30,000 in the Park/Town Hall Sinking Fund, $17,000 in the Community Partnership Sinking Fund, and $28,000 in the Impact Fees accounts.

Clerk-Treasurer Report:
Correspondence - In the absence of Clerk-Treasurer Salter, Deputy Clerk Wright reported:
· Pool Pass Scholarship - The Village of New Glarus had submitted two requests for Swimming Pool Pass Scholarships for two Town of New Glarus residents. The Village is requesting the Town to reimburse the Village $85 for a family (two to four children category) and $40 for another family (additional family member category) for a total of $125. There was no objection to paying $125 to the Village for the Town’s share of the Pool Pass Scholarship.

· The Clerk’s office issued Roadway Excavation Permit #RE800-18 to Duane and Janet Sherven. The Shervens have hired Lovelace Well and Pump to bore a passage beneath Marty Road to extend existing water from the east side of the road to a new heifer shed on the west side. 

For future consideration: acceptable forms of “Cash Deposit”.  K. Seward asked Dale Hustad if there was any objection to add to the permit form deposit by cashier’s check or money order in lieu of cash deposit or letter of credit.  Seward stated that in the case of the Sherven permit, the Town accepted a $1,000 check from the contractor that would not be cashed unless it was needed. Dale Hustad noted a personal check has no guarantee that it is good.  R. Elkins thought a personal check would be appropriate if submitted a week in advance so that it could clear the bank before work is scheduled to begin; he was not in favor of a policy that accepted a personal check be held without cashing it.  Dale Hustad considered a cashier’s check and money order to be equivalent to cash and would not object if the Town decided to add it to the Excavation Permit form. 
 
· Election Recount – The Town submitted poll books and absentee ballot information to Green County for the State Supreme Court recount conducted statewide. The results were handed out to our board members. No discrepancies were found. 

· Letter from Representative, Janis Ringhand – Representative Ringhand sent a letter to the board members asking for their input on Governor Walker’s budget adjustment bill. A copy of the letter was distributed to each board member.  Chair Seward stated each member can respond individually if they so wish.

· Recycling Grant Award for 2011 – We received confirmation from State that we will receive a recycling grant for 2011 in the amount of $1,001.69 which is down from the 2010 grant of 1,635.00 which is a reduction of about 38%.

· We received a letter from the Department of Agriculture, Trade, and Consumer Protection stating that spraying for Gypsy Moths will begin sometime between mid-May and early August.

Chairman’s Report:	
· Town/Village Negotiating Committee – K. Seward reported that they are now meeting twice a month. Their next meeting is May 23, 2011.  Seward stated the group is continuing to work out the details on a cost sharing formula for library; both parties are trying to achieve a formula that can be easily understood by the public.  Seward noted that Impact Fees have been collected for pool and library; in Seward’s opinion this money should not be added to the cost sharing, but will be a part of that amount.  These collected fees when paid to the Village should be for capital costs only; they cannot be used for operating expenses.  Seward also noted the Town has given the Village advice that a public works facility site be identified in advance of an offer from a developer to purchase Backtown.

· Quarterly Safety Program – K. Seward explained that he was looking for volunteers to attend quarterly safety programs.  Seward asked D. Nielson and J. Wright if they were benefitting from the experience of presenting and attending safety meetings.  Both stated they already had been trained in fire safety and driving safety so that material was more a review; the information on indoor air quality and safety in the workplace was mostly common sense, but helpful.  K. Seward stated that in addition to the knowledge gained from these sessions, it gave each presenter an opportunity to work with presentation software and hardware and to improve their public speaking abilities.  K. Seward noted the first quarter of 2011 has passed without setting any training goals for this year.  Seward suggested doing the four meetings this year and to evaluate at the end of the year to decide if this should continue.

Parks Commission Report:
· K. Seward made the trustees aware of four vacancies on the Parks Commission and requested the trustees contact possible candidates or forward possible nominees to Parks Commission Chair Russ Whitacre.  Wright briefly reviewed the continuing discussion regarding organizing a Barn Preservation workshop with assistance from UW-Madison Professor Chuck Law and local author and historian Kim Tschudy.

Plan Commission Report:
· K. Seward reported that Dale Hustad’s letter had been received by the Crawford’s; in response the Crawford’s removed the gate and most of the surrounding structure.  Patrolman Nielson visited today and the fence and gate were removed, but the one portion visible in Seward’s photo was still intact today.  Seward estimated a distance of 18 feet from the center of the road to the one side and less to the other side from center.  It was noted that the remaining portion of the gate structure would not impair the Patrolman’s ability to plow or mow.  Action: R. Elkins moved for the Town to send a letter to the Crawford’s that the Town takes no position on the partial fence that was not removed, but if a gate is reinstalled the Town will pursue abandonment of the entire length of Titus Lane; 2nd C. Narveson.  Motion carried.

May 21st – Open Book 9:00-11:00 AM
June 7th – Regular Town Board Meeting 6:30 PM
     	  – Board of Review (to run concurrently with RTB)
        
8:40 PM K. Seward moved to adjourn, 2nd R. Elkins. Motion Carried. 	
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